
MAJOR WILLIAMP. BECKHAMhas
served Camden Military Academy for
eleven years, first as a professor of
military science. He is now the Acad-
emy's assistant Commandant, and has
given untold hours of time and devo-
tion to the school.
Major Beckham feels that everyone

should have a high school education,
and should go to college if possible.
It has always been his purpose to
guide and assist the cadets at CMAso
that they might get the full benefit of
the Academy's training program.
Major Beckham is a dynamic man

who isn't ashamed to say "I'm still
learning-these cadets teach me some-
thing new every day."

COL. JAMEST. DALLASwas born in
Greensboro, North Carolina. He is the
instructor of French I and French II.
He received his A.B. Degree at the
University of South Carolina and did
graduate work at theUniversity ofd'Aix
Marseilles, Aix-en-Provence, France.
Col.Dallas came to Camden Military

Academy in 1958. He has been an
instructor for eleven years and is now
the commandant of cadets.
It has been the goal of Col. Dallas to

make Camden Military Academy as
fine a school as possible, and he has
worked diligently to accomplish this
ideal.
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