
James T. Dallas

After forty years of service at Carlisle Military
School and Camden Military Academy, Lieuten-
ant Colonel James T. Dallas is retiring. Colonel
Dallas, after seven years as a teacher at Carlisle,
came to Camden with Colonel Lanning Risher
in 1958 to open CMA and to serve as its first
Commandant of Cadets. Over his career he also
has served as Academic Dean and as Dean of
Student Activities. He has taught French and
mathematics as well.

Colonel Dallas served in the US Army during
World War II and saw combat in Europe. After
the war, he attended the University of South
Carolina, graduating with a BA in French and
mathematics. As a Fulbright Scholar, he studied
for a year in France at Aix en Provence. He and
his wife Anne have four children and three
grandchildren. For over thirty years, the Dal-
lases made CMA their home, moving just a year
ago from their apartment in the infirmary build-
ing to a home in Camden. For many years, Mrs.
Dallas was school librarian, and every year she
has assisted in any school function where her
helping spirit and musical talent were needed.

Colonel Dallas has been a mainstay in the life
of Camden Military Academy. He always has
had a keen interest in students and an attentive
ear for all who sought his counsel. His friendly
concern for others, his even temper in all situa-
tions, and his sound judgment in affairs of the
school will be missed.
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